Taruna Tomar

From: Sandeep [sandeep.bhadresha@tauriansteel.com]
Sent: Monday, June 23, 2008 1:24 PM

To: Taruna Tomar'

Subject: FW: Carbon Credits

FYI

From: Ravindra [mailto:ravindra.kunawat@tauriansteel.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 07, 2006 10:50 AM

To: 'is@senergyglobal.com’

Subject: FW: Carbon Credits

Dear Mr. Indrajitsingh,
Any development regarding revised agreement please....
Regards,

Ravindra Kunawat

From: Ravindra [mailto:ravindra.kunawat@tauriansteel.com]
Sent: Monday, August 14, 2006 1:10 PM

To: 'Naveen Somasundaram'

Subject: FW: Carbon Credits

REMINDER..........

From: Ravindra [mailto:ravindra.kunawat@tauriansteel.com]
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2006 10:11 AM

To: 'Naveen Somasundaram’

Subject: RE: Carbon Credits

Dear Naveeniji,

Kindly arrange to e-mail to us revised agreement as discussed.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ravindra Kunawat

From: Naveen Somasundaram [mailto:ns@senergyglobal.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 11, 2006 3:22 PM
To: 'Ravindra’
Subject: RE: Carbon Credits

Dear Mr. Ravindra,

Please find attached the consultancy cum success fee post registration emission reduction.

With regards,
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Naveen S
Manager-Operations

Senergy Global Pvt. Ltd.

9th Floor, EROS CORPORATE TOWERS,
Nehru Place

New Delhi - 110019.

T:+91-11-4180 5501.

T: +91-11-4650 6032 (D).

F: +91-11-4180 5504

M : +91-98185 69933

E-Mail: ns@senergyglobal.com

From: Ravindra [mailto:ravindra.kunawat@tauriansteel.com]

Sent:

Tuesday, July 11, 2006 2:55 PM

To: 'Naveen Somasundaram’
Subject: RE: Carbon Credits

Waiting for a mail from your side...............

Thanks & Regards,

Ravindra Kunawat

From: Naveen Somasundaram [mailto:ns@senergyglobal.com]

Sent:

Saturday, July 01, 2006 11:31 AM

To: 'Ravindra’
Subject: RE: Carbon Credits

Dear Ravindra,

As per our telephonic conversation, please find attached the costs for developing your project as an individual
project on consultancy basis. The costs worked out are for developing a small-scaled project activity i.e. upto 15

MW.

Costs

Upfront payment to Senergy Global = Rs. 1,50,000/- (exclusive of taxes) (One time expenditure)
Validation costs = Rs. 4,00,000/- (One time expenditure)

Annual verification costs = Rs. 2,50,000/- (Recurring expenditure)

CER Registration/Issuance Fee = Linked to the number of CERs.

(upto the first 15,000 CERs charged at USD 0.10 per CER
and above 15,000 CERs charged at USD 0.20 per CER)
Taurian has 7 machines of 1.25 MW Suzlon make and taking
the generation as 25,00,000 kwWh per machine, the total
number of CERs generated from the project would be 14000
CERs annually.

14000 CERs @ USD 0.10 per CER = USD 1400 = Rs.
63,000/- (Recurring expenditure) (1 USD=Rs.45)

UN Adaptation Fund = 2% of the CERs goes to the United Nations Adaptation Fund
annually.
Senergy Global's share = 4% of the CERs annually.
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In case of any further assistance, please feel free to get in touch with me.

With regards,

Naveen S
Manager-Operations

Senergy Global Pvt. Ltd.

9th Floor, EROS CORPORATE TOWERS,
Nehru Place

New Delhi - 110019.

T:+91-11-4180 5501.

T: +91-11-4650 6032 (D).

F: +91-11-4180 5504

M : +91-98185 69933

E-Mail: ns@senergyglobal.com

From: Ravindra [mailto:ravindra.kunawat@tauriansteel.com]
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2006 5:56 PM

To: ns@senergyglobal.com

Cc: 'Sisir Chanda'; 'mayur.patel’

Subject: RE: Carbon Credits

From: SisirChanda [mailto:sisir.chanda@tauriansteel.com]

Sent: Friday, June 16, 2006 4:27 PM

To: mayur.patel@tauriansteel.com; ravindra.kunawat@tauriansteel.com
Subject: FW: Carbon Credits

Dear Mr. Naveen,
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Kindly e-mail to us the cost involved, in case we go as single project for our 7 Wind mills of 1.25 MW each.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ravindra Kunawat
Tel no. +6669 8018

From: Naveen Somasundaram [mailto:ns@senergyglobal.com]
Sent: Friday, June 16, 2006 9:12 AM

To: sisir.chanda@tauriansteel.com

Subject: Carbon Credits

Dear Sir,

As per our telephonic conversation, please find attached
1. Our standard Proposal.
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2. Soft copy of the agreement for Fixed Price Post Registration.
3. Soft copy of the agreement for Success Fee Post Registration.

Kindly study the same and revert back to me.

In case of any further assistance, please feel free to get in touch with me.

Thanking you.
Yours truly,

Naveen S
Manager-Operations

Senergy Global Pvt. Ltd.

9th Floor, EROS CORPORATE TOWERS,
Nehru Place

New Delhi - 110019.

T :+91-11-4180 5501.

T: +91-11-4650 6032 (D).

F: +91-11-4180 5504

M : +91-98185 69933

E-Mail: ns@senergyglobal.com

This message has been scanned for viruses and
dangerous content by MailScanner, and is
believed to be clean.
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