"Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris" To "Payal Ghosh - E & Y" <Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com>
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislif
esciences.com>

08/08/2007 04:47 PM

Please respond to Subject RE: Submission of PCN and PDD for HCA

<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifes
ciences.com>

cC

bce

Dear Payal,

Sorry for the delayed response. We would like to inform you that wee have
submitted the documnets as per your email.
the documents were couriered to MOEF.

Regards

Bhavesh Prajapati

"Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris"”
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>
27/06/2007 05:04 PM

Please respond to
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>

Dear Payal,

I have gone through the documents and arraning toc courier
the documents

soon.Will revert back once its done from our end.

regards

bhavesh

To
<Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com>
cc

Subject
RE: Project Idea Note.

Payal Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN
11/06/2007 11:16 AM

To
bhavesh.prajapatifclarislifesciences.com
cc

VVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVYVVYVYVYV



Payal To <Payal jhaveri@abellonbioenergy.com>
Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstY
oung/IN

10/04/2008 03:19 PM

cc Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris.bhaveshprajapati@yahoo.com
bcc Payal Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN
Subject Fw: Submission of PCN and PDD for HCA

 History: & This message has been forwarded.

"Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris” <bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>

To <Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com>

27/06/2007 05:04 PM
cC

e ] Subject RE: Project Idea Note.

~ Please respond to a
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>
e e

Dear Payal,

I have gone through the documents and arraning toc courier the
documents soon.Will revert back once its done from our end.

regards

bhavesh

Payal
Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstY To bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com
oung/IN

11/06/2007 11:16 AM

cc
Subject Submission of PCN and PDD for HCA

Dear Bhavesh ji,

Please find enclosed herewith the copies of PDD and PCN that has to be sent for Host Country Approval.

Kindly ensure that 20 copies of PDD and PCN are to be binded together-the PCN should come in first
followed by the PDD and both should be binded together as one single copy. Similarly 20 binded copies
of PDD and PCN should be made.

Two CDs, each containing one scanned copy of the forwarding letter (to be taken on your letter head) ,
PDD and PCN should be also enclosed with the documents. All of these along with the forwarding letter
(hard copy) will have to be couriered to the Ministry.

2]

PCH doc.zip PDD.doc.zip

Regards



Payal.

"Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris” <bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>

15/05/2007 05:04 PM To <Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com>

({0

D il - e ] i - i N .
Please respond to Subject RE: Project Idea Note
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>

Dear Payal,

Gone though the PDD.Have a few observations. Will call you sometime
tomorrow.

regards

bhavesh

Payal
Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstY To Payal Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN@EYI-AP
oung/IN

e s cc

Subject Fw: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Dear Mr.Bhavesh,

Please find attached the First Draft PDD for your project. Kindly go through the same and provide us with your
feedback.

Regards

From: Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com [mailto:Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com]
Sent: Friday, March 23, 2007 5:18 PM

To: bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com

Subject: travel plan

Importance: High

Dear Bhavesh ji,

As you are aware ,the PDD is the most crucial document, we would require almost a month for providing
you with this document. In the meanwhile, 1 am also planning a visit to your plant in the next week. Will let
you know the details of my travel schedule soon.



regards
payal
"Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris” <bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>

09/03/2007 05:04 PM To <Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com>

cc
Subject RE: Project Idea Note.

~ Please respond to
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>
b

Dear Payal,

When can we expect our PDD as we are awaiting these documents since long. Can you let us
know the final schedule of other documents including PDD per return email ?

Thannks and Regards

Bhavesh Prajapati
Payal Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN

16/02/2007 04:39 PM TO Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris
cc
Subject Fw: Project Idea Note.

Dear Bhavesh ji,

Please find attached the modified PIN. The current version for the methodology is Version 9 and
the document has been modified accordingly.

regards

-—- Forwarded by Payal Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN on 10/03/2008 04:36 PM —--
"Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris” <bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>

To

01/02/2007 04:32 PM <Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com>

cc

[remenms - - e R U PR . L T AT N UL S PSRN H - i
Please respond to Subject RE: Project Idea Note.
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>




Dear Payal,

This refers to the telephonic discussions we had today morning regarding the documents.
We request you make the changes as per our discussions of today morning and send us the
documents at the earliest.

Thanks and Regards

Bhavesh Prajapati
From: Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris [mailto:bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 24, 2007 3:27 PM

To: Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com
Subject: RE: Project Idea Note.

Dear Payal,

Regret the delayed response. Thanks for the documents. We shall revert back very soon on the
same haivng gone thru in detail.

Regards

Bhavesh Prajapati

From: Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com [mailto:Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 20 , 2007 3:14 PM

To: bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com

Subject: Project Idea Note.
Importance: High

Dear Bhavesh ji,

We have just received the information required. However please find the Project Idea Note for your project
activity. The methodology used is AMS-I,C,Version 08.

In case of any clarifications, please revert. I have highlighted some portions.Please confirm.

Warm Regards,



ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Payal Ghosh

Associate Consultant

Risk and Business Solutions

BRS * ESS * FIDS * F&PM * TSRS

Phone: +91 - 33 — 2281 1224 Mobile:  +91 — 9830517388
Fax: +91 — 33-2281 7750 URL: http://www.ey.com/in

-——- Forwarded by Payal Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN on 10/03/2008 03:08 PM -—-
"Bhavesh Prajapati - Claris”
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>
To "Payal Ghosh - E & Y" <Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com>
12/01/2007 03:07 PM cc

Subject FW: additional information requirements for the CDM
project of Claris

~ Please respond to
<bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com>

Dear Payal,

Can you let us know when should we receive the first document from your end ?
regards

Bhavesh

From: Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com [mailto:Payal.Ghosh@in.ey.com]

Sent: Monday, january 04, 2007 2:59 PM

To: bhavesh.prajapati@clarislifesciences.com

Subject: additional information requirements for the CDM project of Claris
Importance: High

Dear Mr.Bhavesh,

As per our communication today , please find the replies to your queries:

1. Biomass Availability Report: This is the assessment that is usually carried by the consultants.



Also please provide us the configuration of your proposed project activity; whether any separate
turbine would be installed for additional power requirements.

On the basis of the telecom today, we are assuming the boiler efficiency to be100 % and it would be
fixed for monitoring of the same. The steam demand for process requirements (6 TPH) is the same as
that of the pre project scenario.

Warm Regards,
ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Payal Ghosh

Associate Consultant

Risk and Business Solutions

BRS * ESS * FIDS * F&PM * TSRS

Phone: +91 - 33 —-2281 1224 Mobile:  +91 —9830517388
Fax: +91 — 33-2281 7750 URL: http://www.ey.com/in

———- Forwarded by Payal Ghosh/RAS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN on 10/03/2008 02:55 PM ——-
Payal
Ghosh/RABS/Calcutta/ErnstYou

ng/IN
Tio) : ol
nilesh.patil@clarislifesciences.com

cc Ajeya Bandyopadhyay/RABS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN@EYI-AP, Shuvendu

Bose/RABS/Calcutta/ErnstYoung/IN@EYI-AP
Subject additional information requirements for the CDM project of Claris

28/12/2006 07:15 PM

Dear Mr.Patel,

We have studied the Project Report provided by you and we require some additional set of
information for the completion of the Project Design Document.

Please find enclosed herewith the excel sheet detailing the additional information requirements.

Kindly provide the data at the earliest.

Regards,



ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Payal Ghosh

Associate Consultant

Risk and Business Solutions

BRS * ESS * FIDS * F&PM * TSRS

Phone: +91 - 33 — 2281 1224 Mobile:  +91 — 9830517388
Fax: +91 — 33-2281 7750 URL: http://www.ey.com/in

The information contained in this communication is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is
addressed and others authorized to receive it. It may contain confidential or legally privileged information. If you are not
the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking any action in reliance on
the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this communication in
error, please notify us immediately by responding to this email and then delete it from your system. Ernst & Young is
neither liable for the proper and complete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any

delay in its receipt.

Shuvendu
Bose/RABS/Calcutta/Ernst To <pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com>
Young/IN o

01/12/2006 11:02 AM )
Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience[Z]

Dear Sir,

As per our telecon today, please find the engagement letter. Kindly ptake two printouts, initial on each
page and sign on main page and send it across. We will get it duly signed by our partner and send you
back one copy.

If you can send the EL today, we can start work next week. As | will be out of country since 21st, | want to
provide the first deliverable beforehand.

Thanks and Regards,

ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Shuvendu Bose

Shuvendu
Bose/RABS/Calcutta/Ernst To <pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com>




Young/IN
29/12/2006 10:50 AM

CcC

Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience[]

Dear Sir,

My system had given me a Success fee of 8% which | had reduced to 6.5% honouring yourself
and looking at relationship with Claris. | am sorry to say that it wont be possible for us to take on the
asignment at a lower success fees.

Thanks and Regards,

ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Shuvendu Bose

"Pankaj Patel - Claris™

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescie To <Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com>
nces.com>

14/12/2006 05:31 PM
Please respond to
<pankaj.patel@clarislifescienc
es.com>

cc
Subject RE: Carbon credit

Dear Shuvendu,

| am back in office.l will take stock of the situation tonight .
Will revert on the same'

Regards

Pankaj Patel

Head-Projects

Claris Lifesciences Ltd.

Corporate Towers, Nr. Parimal Crossing,
Ellisbridge, Ahmedabad — 380006 INDIA
Tel: +91-79-26563331

Fax: +91-79-26408053
pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com
www._clarislifesciences.com

From: Shuvendu Bose [mailto:Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 6, 2006 4:50 PM

To: pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com

Subject: Fw: Carbon credit



Dear Mr Patel,

Please let me know when you are returning to India. The coordinators from your side
( Both Nilesh and Ashish) are young enough and not able to convey the legal terms and
conditions for CDM aspects. The similar engagement and clauses are signed by Claris earlier with
E&Y and there should have been no issue in getting this one signed.
Please see the attached signed EL of Claris with Exhibit B&C for clause 49 engagement and

present EL .

| request you also not to forward this mail to them as this might not be morally right and this is a
clause 49 engagement meant for senior management only.

Thanks and Regards,

ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Shuvendu Bose
"Pankaj Patel - Claris™

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescie To <ashish.shah@clarislifesciences.com>, "Shuvendu Bose"
nces.com> <shuvendu.bose@in.ey.com>
29/11/2006 08:17 PM cc "Nilesh Patil" <ni|eSh.pati|@C|ari5|ifesciences.C0m>
Please respond to Subject RE: Carbon credit
<pankaj.patel@clarislifescienc
es.com>

Dear Shuvendu,
Could you close matter and start working on our project?
Regards

Pankaj Patel

"Pankaj Patel - Claris™

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescie To <Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com>
nces.com>

22/11/2006 07:34 PM
Please respond to

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescienc
es.com>

CcC

Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Dear Shuvendu,
We have through the proposal sent by you .
based on overall undestanding and efforts we are comfortable with 5 % of success rate .

6.5 % would be too high .



Could you close the deal at 5 % ?

Regards

Pankaj Patel

Head-Projects

Claris Lifesciences Ltd.

Corporate Towers, Nr. Parimal Crossing,
Ellisbridge, Ahmedabad — 380006 INDIA
Tel: +91-79-26563331

Fax: +91-79-26408053
pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com
www.clarislifesciences.com

From: Shuvendu Bose [mailto:Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 09, 2006 12:29 PM

To: pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com

Subject: RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Dear Sir,

Please find the revised ELs as per our discussion yesterday. | could not get the
permission from our management for 50% on registration. The revised quote talks about 8Lacs
Fixed Fees and 6.5 % Success fees with Fixed fee payment schedule as
25% on Signing of EL,

25% on MOEF approval,
25% on Validation and Balance 25% on registration of the project.

Thanks and Regards,

"Pankaj Patel - Claris"

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescie To <Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com>
nces.com>

31/10/2006 05:30 PM
Please respond to

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescienc
es.com>

cc "Shuvendu Bose" <Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com>

Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Dear Sudipta

Since | am not travelling | can meet in our Office and then we will proceed for factory which is 27th KM
away from City .



Is it fine with you ?
Regards

Pankaj patel

From: Sudipta Das [mailto:Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com]
Sent: Friday, October 18, 2006 5:27 PM

To: pankaj patel

Cc: Shuvendu Bose

Subject: Re: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Pankaj

Unfortunately both Shuvendu as well as I am tied up with client
commitments till end of the month. Shuvendu can meet you in your office
either . Pls let me know if any of these days work out for you and if
so, pls suggest meeting time

Regards
Sudipta

"Pankaj Patel - Claris"

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescie To <Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com>
nces.com> . , . o
cc "Aditya Handa" <aditya.handa@clarislifesciences.com>,
11/10/2006 01:21 PM "Shuvendu Bose"” <Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com>
Please respond to Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience
<pankaj.patel@clarislifescienc
es.com>

Dear Sudipta,
We have gone through the details sent by you and would like to persue assignment with your firm .

Is it possible for you to make a quick visit to us on Saturday or Monday so that we can conclude many
things in our office.?

Please let us know your schdeule for this ?
Regards

Pankaj Patel
Head-Projects
Claris Lifesciences Ltd.



Corporate Towers, Nr. Parimal Crossing,
Ellisbridge, Ahmedabad — 380006 INDIA

Tel: +91

-79-26563331

Fax: +91-79-26408053
pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com

www.clarislifesciences.com

————— Original Message-----

From: Sudipta Das [mailto:Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com]
Sent: Firday, September 29, 2006 1:16 PM
To: pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com

Cc: Aditya Handa; Shuvendu Bose

Subject: RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Dear Pankaj

| am sending you the following

1. Our draft engagement letter for CDM advisory services

2. Our capability statement for CDM advisory services

On getting your concurrence on the draft EL, we will finalise it

Regards

Sudipta

ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Sudipta Das

Partner

Risk and Business Solutions

BRS * ESS * FIDS * F&PM * TSRS

Phone: +91 -33 - 2281 1144
Assistant: Haimanti Chaudhuri
Fax: +91 - 33 - 2281 7750

Mobile:

Phone:
URI::

+91 — 98300 43428
+91 - 33 - 2281 1224 -29 (Extn.113)
http://www.ey.com/in

"Pankaj Patel - Claris™



<pankaj.patel@clarislifescie To <Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com>

nees com= cc "Aditya Handa" <aditya.handa@clarislifesciences.com>,
15/09/2007 12:39 PM "Shuvendu Bose" <Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com>
Please respond to Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience
<pankaj.patel@clarislifescienc
es.com>
Dear Sudipta,

It was nice talking to you on above said subject and got feedback too.
We are very much interested in taking carbon credit for sure .
Could you send your proposal for two projects ?

(1) Co-genration Facility -comprising of 16 TPH high pressure steam boiler and 2 MW steam turbine.We
also produce 2500 no of bricks from Ash generated from this unit too .

(2) Plastic reprocessing unit-This unit is processing 5 ton of plastic scrap everyday and converting into
Plastic grannuels.

We have plan for another high pressure boiler based on Dry agro waste.But we would like to have your
proposal for above mention two projects.

Regards

Pankaj Patel

Head-Projects

Claris Lifesciences Ltd.

Corporate Towers, Nr. Parimal Crossing,
Ellisbridge, Ahmedabad — 380006 INDIA
Tel: +91-79-26563331

Fax: +91-79-26408053
pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com
www_clarislifesciences.com

"Pankaj Patel - Claris™

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescie To <Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com>
nces.com>

05/09/2006 01:18 PM
Please respond to

<pankaj.patel@clarislifescienc
es.com>

cC "Shuvendu Bose" <Shuvendu.Bose@in.ey.com>

Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Dear Sudipta
It's fine with me

Regards



Pankaj Patel

From: Sudipta Das [mailto:Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com]
Sent: Tuesday, September 5, 2006 11:46 AM
To: pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com

Cc: Shuvendu Bose

Subject: RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Pankaj

Can we have a quick discussion today at 5pm? | will give you a call on your cell.

Pls confirm.
Regards

Sudipta

ERNST & YOUNG ®
Ernst & Young Pvt. Ltd

Sudipta Das
Partner

Risk and Business Solutions

BRS * ESS * FIDS * F&PM * TSRS

Phone: +91 - 33 — 2281 1144 Mobile:  +91 - 98300 43428
Assistant: Haimanti Chaudhuri Phone: +91 - 33 - 2281 1224 -29 (Extn.113)
Fax: +91 - 33 - 2281 7750 URL: http://www.ey.com/in

"Pankaj Patel - Claris"
<pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.c
om>

30/08/2006 09:52 AM

Please respondto
 <pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.co

m>

To <Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com>, "Nikhil Mohta" <Nikhil. Mohta@carlyle.com>
cc <aditya.handa@clarislifesciences.com>, "Bharat Gulia"
<Bharat.Gulia@in.ey.com>, "Dilip Dusija" <Dilip.Dusija@in.ey.com>, "Manish
Gaur" <manish.gaur@carlyle.com>, "Shankar Narayanan"
<shankar.narayanan@carlyle.com>, <sushil. handa@clarislifesciences.com>
Subject RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience



Dear Sudipta,

With respect to above subject,| would like to interact with you for two diffrent projects which were
put up in year 2006 .These are
1) Co-Generation Facility-Comprising of 16 TPH high pressure boiler and 2 MW of steam turbine

.We are firing dry agro waste i.e Castor Deoiled Cake and we are initiator of this fuel too .

2) Plastic Reprocessing units-We are bulk consumer of food grade plastic .In the process we
generate process scrap and this scrap we recycle with help of impoerted technology and make
grannules from this scrap .the quality of this scrap is better than Vergin Plastic available in India
and therfore one can use this very well. Everyday we process 5000Kg of LDPE scrap and generate

grannules from the same .Thus we are saving burning of fossile fuel to this extent .

With this breif ,| would like to interact with you for carbon credit for us .Since | am handling
projects directly in the company | will drive this project .

Please not my cell number -9825007520 .

Regards

Pankaj Patel

Head-Projects

Claris Lifesciences Ltd.

Corporate Towers, Nr. Parimal Crossing,
Ellisbridge, Ahmedabad — 380006 INDIA
Tel: +91-79-26563331

Fax: +91-79-26408053
pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com

www.clarislifesciences.com

From: Sudipta Das [mailto:Sudipta.Das@in.ey.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 17, 2006 9:06 AM

To: Nikhil Mohta

Cc: aditya.handa@clarislifesciences.com; Bharat Gulia; Dilip Dusija; Manish Gaur;
pankaj.patel@clarislifesciences.com; Shankar Narayanan; sushil.handa@clarislifesciences.com
Subject: RE: Carbon Credits for Claris Lifescience

Dear Aditya / Pankaj

Please let me know if we can discuss about your captive power project sometime this afternoon.
Also, please send me your phone numbers

Regards

Sudipta

ERNST & YOUNG ®



